

RESOLUTION 2026-04-13-04

BE IT RESOLVED, that the Shelby County Commission hereby awards the bid for Doors and Door Hardware to the lowest responsive bidder for each item as highlighted below. The awarded bidders are Building Specialties, Electronic Access Specialists, Inc dba Southern Lock & Supply and Lockcorp Inc.

<u>Doors and Frames</u>	Building Specialties	Electronic Access Specialists, Inc. dba Southern Lock & Supply	Lockcorp Inc.
<u>Metal Doors</u>			
3' x 7' Hollow Metal Door 18ga Non Handed Not Rated	\$636.00	\$462.18	\$590.00
3'x 6'8" Hollow Metal Door 18ga Non Handed Not Rated	\$610.00	\$454.88	\$740.00
3' x 7' Hollow Metal Door Undersized for Cont. Hinge Not Rated	\$770.00	\$462.18	\$670.00
3' x 7' Hollow Metal Door 18ga Non Handed 20min Fire Label	\$675.00	\$462.18	\$670.00
3' x 7' Hollow Metal Door 18ga Non Handed 45min Fire Label	\$700.00	\$462.18	\$650.00
3'x 6'8" Hollow Metal Door 18ga Non Handed 20 min Fire Label	\$658.00	\$454.88	\$650.00
3'x 6'8" Hollow Metal Door 18ga Non Handed 45min Fire Label	\$710.00	\$454.88	\$990.00
3'6" x 7'0" Hollow Metal Door	\$685.00	\$487.76	\$385.00
3' x 7' Hollow Metal Frame 16ga Right Hand Not Rated	\$355.00	\$185.72	\$330.00
3' x 7' Hollow Metal Frame 16ga Left Hand Not Rated	\$355.00	\$185.72	\$330.00
3' x 6'8" Hollow Metal Frame 16ga Right Hand Not Rated	\$345.00	\$185.72	\$330.00
3' x 6'8" Hollow Metal Frame 16ga Left Hand Not Rated	\$345.00	\$185.72	\$330.00
3' x 7' Hollow Metal Frame 16ga Right Hand 20min Fire Label	\$375.00	\$185.72	\$365.00
3' x 7' Hollow Metal Frame 16ga Left Hand 20min Fire Label	\$375.00	\$185.72	\$365.00
3' x 7' Hollow Metal Frame 16ga Right Hand 45min Fire Label	\$385.00	\$185.72	\$365.00
3' x 7' Hollow Metal Frame 16ga Left Hand 45min Fire Label	\$385.00	\$185.72	\$365.00
3' x 6'8" Hollow Metal Frame 16ga Right Hand 20min Fire Label	\$355.00	\$185.72	\$350.00
3' x 6'8" Hollow Metal Frame 16ga Left Hand 20min Fire Label	\$355.00	\$185.72	\$350.00

3' x 6'8" Hollow Metal Frame 16ga Right Hand 45min Fire Label	\$365.00	\$185.72	\$350.00
3' x 6'8" Hollow Metal Frame 16ga Left Hand 45min Fire Label	\$365.00	\$185.72	\$350.00
<u>Doors and Frames</u>	Building Specialties	Electronic Access Specialists, Inc. dba Southern Lock & Supply	Lockcorp Inc.
555-12" 26D Metal Door	\$30.00	\$13.67	\$45.00
<u>Wood Doors</u>			
3' x 7' Solid Core Wood Door Non Rated	\$385.00	\$752.40	\$460.00
3' x 6'8" Solid Core Wood Door Non Rated	\$355.00	\$691.68	\$430.00
3' x 7' Solid Core Wood Door 20min Fire Label	\$405.00	\$752.40	\$440.00
3' x 7' Solid Core Wood Door 45min Fire Label	\$750.00	\$1,276.44	No Bid
3' x 6'8" Solid Core Wood Door 20min Fire Label	\$375.00	\$691.68	\$470.00
3' x 6'8" Solid Core Wood Door 45min Fire Label	\$735.00	\$1,358.28	\$985.00
3' x 6'8" Solid Wood Dutch Door (No Glass Kit/Glass) 20min Fire Label	\$875.00	\$1,149.74	\$1,650.00
NSWDPURCH Prefinished PS White Maple Wood Door Wd Dr	No Bid	\$175.56	No Bid
<u>Glass/Glass Kits</u>			
LT-B1 3x33 Glass Kit	\$90.00	\$63.06	\$300.00
LT-B1 22x30 Glass Kit	\$105.00	\$73.36	\$210.00
4" x 34" Tempered Glass	\$60.00	\$45.69	\$65.00
23" x 31" Tempered Glass	\$105.00	\$79.79	\$150.00
Labor to install Glass Kit/Glass in new Door	\$60.00	No Bid	No Bid
Labor to install Glass Kit/Glass in existing Door	\$1,000.00	No Bid	No Bid
<u>Door Hardware</u>			
ND53J RHO 626 Schlage Entry Lock Less Cylinder	\$456.00	\$433.58	\$510.00
ND40S RHO 626 Schlage Privacy	\$435.00	\$392.83	\$460.00
ND10S RHO 626 Schlage Passage	\$435.00	\$340.71	\$460.00
ND80JD RHO 626 Schlage Storeroom Lock Less Cylinder	\$456.00	\$433.58	\$510.00
ND70JD 613 Schlage Storeroom Lock	\$456.00	\$433.58	\$510.00
23-030 006D 135 Core Cylinder	\$122.00	\$70.61	\$125.00

81-0723 Thru Bolt	No Bid	\$2.59	\$10.00
01-1495 Screws, IS Plate Cover Spindle	No Bid	\$1.72	\$10.00
82-3082 Lock	No Bid	\$9.09	\$10.00
82-0368 Lock	No Bid	\$9.09	\$10.00
STRW 6 409-10B Concave Wall	\$12.00	\$4.64	\$9.00
STRW 9 441-10B Low Dome Floor	\$12.00	\$22.25	\$9.00
NSCY 23-030x613D 135 Schlage Everest IC Core 0 Bit Cylinder	\$300.00	\$70.61	\$310.00
<u>Doors and Frames</u>	Building Specialties	Electronic Access Specialists, Inc. dba Southern Lock & Supply	Lockcorp Inc.
NSCY50-123 Schlage Everest Bitting List Cylinder	\$300.00	\$180.54	\$310.00
NSCY 30-137-625 LFIC Housing Cylinder	\$95.00	\$60.18	\$96.00
CYKBSC S26206 9 26D 3B Housing for Schlage LFIC	\$300.00	\$13.17	\$290.00
NSLO ND70JD RHO 613 Schlage Office Lock	\$456.00	\$447.80	\$496.00
NSLO 14-2 CW 613 Schlage Door Saver	\$80.00	\$28.21	\$72.00
NSCY 20 740x626 IC Primus	\$385.00	\$112.31	\$200.00
NSCY 20-030 626 Cylinder	\$185.00	\$71.08	\$160.00
NSED 996Lx06 32D LHR Exit Device Trim	No Bid	\$595.99	\$680.00
NSCY ICS-26D-AR LFIC Mortise Cylinder	\$85.00	\$13.27	\$70.00
DLSC 7A B662Jx626 Double Cylinder for LFIC	\$350.00	\$135.05	\$300.00
HIMP 5MP79 4.5x4.5 26D Hinge	\$11.00	\$5.51	\$25.00
NSLO L9050L 03A 630 Schlage Mortise Lock Less Cylinder	\$802.00	\$640.18	\$810.00
CFM83HD1 TKS 1234UCZ21 Full Mortise AL 7'0" DR	\$195.00	\$163.95	\$240.00
EN1431UOxTB Alum TRI Pack-Heavy Arm Door Closer	\$405.00	\$346.61	\$450.00
STRW 4 409-32D Wall Stop Concave	\$6.00	\$3.01	\$5.00
NSED QEL 3347 A-L (360L trim) 3' 613 (for up to 9' Door) Exit Device	No Bid	\$3,442.78	\$3,412.00
BYS PS902x2RS Power Supply	No Bid	\$344.49	\$420.00
NSED 3347 A-L (360L trim) 3' 613 (for up to 9' Door) Exit Device	No Bid	\$2,416.11	\$2,695.00
8888F-32D Sargent Exit Device	\$1,315.00	\$1,135.49	\$2,495.00

56-8888F-32D Sargent Electrified Exit Device	\$1,718.00	\$1,754.57	\$2,500.00
713-8 ETL 626 Sargent Exit Trim	\$604.00	\$499.30	\$659.00
1800-3'x689 Silver Yale Exit Device	\$418.00	\$201.65	\$410.00
217F-689 Silver Butterfly Pull Trim for 1800 Series Exit Device	\$85.00	\$58.97	\$72.00
CFM83HD1 Alum Continuous Hinge Full Mortise	\$195.00	\$163.95	\$245.00
QDC111689 S/TA Stanley Door Closer Cast Iron Body	No Bid	\$218.32	\$470.00
SC61RwPAx695 Falcon Tri Pac Door Closer	\$150.00	\$80.01	\$200.00
484 26D Sargent Deadlock for Standard Cores	\$345.00	\$200.51	\$285.00
B660J 626 Schlage Deadlock w/Thumbturn for IC Cores	\$365.00	\$123.68	\$280.00
<u>Doors and Frames</u>	Building Specialties	Electronic Access Specialists, Inc. dba Southern Lock & Supply	Lockcorp Inc.
B660P 626 Schlage Deadlock w/Thumbturn for Standard Cores	\$365.00	\$156.37	\$367.00
D135 Core Cylinder Schlage Primus	\$375.00	\$70.61	\$335.00
LV-IY 24 x 24 Louver – Dark Bronze	\$265.00	\$137.71	\$280.00
L-VRSG-3 24" x 24" Vandal Louver	\$935.00	\$473.62	\$667.00
SC71RwPA-ALUM Door Closer	\$225.00	\$157.27	\$380.00
315CN Alum Sweep	\$23.00	\$12.50	\$60.00
487 26D Classroom Deadbolt (standard core)	\$285.00	\$143.03	\$280.00
70C 4X16 32D Push Plate	\$25.00	\$10.87	\$30.00
107x70C 4x16 32D Pull Plate	\$33.00	\$40.34	\$95.00
Threshold – 3 ft. Smooth	\$44.00	\$28.91	\$45.00
Threshold – 4 ft. Smooth	\$60.00	\$38.54	\$61.00
Threshold – 6 ft. Smooth	\$90.00	\$57.81	\$79.00
Threshold – 8 ft. Smooth	\$120.00	\$77.08	\$120.00
Threshold – 3 ft. with stop	\$75.00	\$39.34	\$90.00
Threshold – 4 ft. with stop	\$94.00	\$42.75	\$102.00
Threshold – 6 ft. with stop	\$120.00	\$64.13	\$181.86
Threshold – 8 ft. with stop	\$147.00	\$85.50	\$250.00
Overhead Door Stop	\$245.00	\$127.86	\$350.00
<u>% Markup above bidders actual cost on all other catalog listed items</u>	25%	40%	35%

Said eBid #2026-3-11648 is located within the office of the Chief Financial Officer.

